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Dr Lucie Danti Called in 2021    +44 (0)20 7583 9241

Lucie was called to the Bar by Gray’s Inn in July 2021. Lucie joined Chambers as a tenant in October 2022, following successful
completion of her pupillage.

Lucie has a busy court practice, appearing in person and remotely. She takes instructions in small and fast track cases, acting for
both Claimants and Defendants in matters relating to road traffic accidents, personal injury and credit hire. Lucie is also
developing a paperwork practice and accepts instructions to draft pleadings, schedules and counter schedules and to advise on
liability and quantum.

Clinical Negligence
Lucie has a particular interest in clinical negligence and draws upon her unique insight into patient care and clinical settings,
gained during her previous career as an NHS Doctor.

Her wide ranging exposure to a variety of clinical specialties enables Lucie to analyse medical evidence astutely and confidently.
Lucie is happy to draft pleadings, schedules and counter schedules for clients in relation to clinical negligence cases.

Personal Injury
Lucie is developing her personal injury practice and accepts instructions for both Claimants and Defendants in road traffic
accidents. Lucie is happy to draft pleadings and schedules in relation to personal injury cases.
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Credit Hire
Lucie is regularly instructed to appear on behalf of Defendants and Claimants in matters relating to credit hire. She is
experienced at dealing with all aspects of credit hire that arise during the process of credit hire litigation.

Regulatory & Disciplinary
Lucie has an interest in all matters relating to regulatory and disciplinary law, whilst having a particular interest in the medical
profession and allied medical professions. Lucie has experience representing the Health Care and Professions Council in Fitness
to Practice substantive hearings and welcomes instructions in this area.

Inquests
Lucie’s most recent experience involved representing a family at a four-day inquest. Their daughter, had been under the care of
an NHS Trust’s specialist mental health team at the time of her death. The Coroner concluded that there had been shortfalls in
care, management and treatment and issued a Prevention of Future Deaths Report.

Lucie has an interest in all matters relating to inquests. She has volunteered for AvMA and continues to grow and develop her
practice in this area, which overlaps with her clinical negligence background and unique insight from her previous career as an
NHS doctor.

Public Law
Lucie has an interest in Public Law and is keen to develop her practice in this field.

If you would like to instruct Dr Lucie Danti or would like help or advice in doing so, please call and talk to our excellent clerking
team, led by senior clerk Alan Kilbey MBE. Our phone number is +44 (0)20 7583 9241. Alternatively, please email us at
chambers@farrarsbuilding.co.uk

For more information about our clerking team, please click here for the clerks page.

Appointments & Memberships

The Honourable Society of Gray’s Inn
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General Medical Council

 

Education & Qualifications

2019 – 2020: BPTC, City Law School

2017 – 2019: Graduate Diploma in Law (GDL), Oxford Brookes University

2000 – 2006: Bachelor of Medicine & Bachelor of Surgery (MB.,ChB), University of Glasgow

2003 – 2004: Bachelor of Science (BSc.(MedSci)), University of Glasgow

 

Scholarships, Prizes and Awards

2019: Prince of Wales Scholarship, The Honourable Society of Gray’s Inn

2019: BPTC Scholarship, City Law School

2019: Winner, Oxford Brookes Client Interviewing Competition

2017: Winner, Richard Ramsey Mooting Competition

 

Testimonials

Following a recent inquest in which Lucie represented the family:

“[The family were] very appreciative of Lucie Danti’s support and the overall outcome. I would endorse this. Lucie was very
professional in her approach and had a good grasp of the issues, particularly having only been instructed a few days before the
Inquest. I enjoyed working with her. She  established a good rapport with the clients, addressing their concerns and obtained an
outcome that more than satisfied their expectations.”

Dino Skinner – Managing Partner, Healys Solicitors.

 

“Dr Lucie Danti recently represented me in court. In preparation for my court appearance she was meticulous in her attention to
detail, not only in her thorough examination of all the evidence but in the delivery of that evidence, her cross examination and
thoughtful questioning. She most certainly went over and above what I expected in terms of communication before and during
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the court appearance. She was extremely composed during proceedings and her calm and supportive manner gave me
confidence and enabled me to see beyond the stress and anxiety that I was feeling.

I very much appreciate the knowledge and support I received from Lucie Danti and I feel very fortunate to have been represented
by her.“

Previous Employment

Prior to commencing her legal studies, Lucie worked as a junior doctor for the NHS, which has provided her with a unique insight
into patient care and clinical settings. The role involved working within ward based clinical teams in a variety of medical
specialties, coordinating inpatient care between departments and taking instruction from/liaising with, medical and nursing
colleagues.

 

Personal Interests

Lucie enjoys jazz music, singing, running slowly and spending time with her family and Irish Terrier, Freddie.
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